
Marilee A. Walker

September 11, 1951 - September 13, 2022


Marilee Adele Walker, daughter of the late John and Lucille (Cox) 
Hardin, was born on September 11, 1951 in Corydon, Iowa and 
departed this life on September 13, 2022. 
 
Marilee graduated from Burlington High School in Burlington, Iowa 
in 1970.


Marilee was saved at an early age and spent her life pouring the 
love of Jesus into her family, friends and those God put in her path. 
 
She was proud of her children, grandchildren, and great-
granddaughters and would gladly share tales of their adventures 
and antics. 
 
She enjoyed playing sports, painting, crocheting, sewing and 
having fun with her family. She had many talents but her specialty 
was taking care of others. She will be greatly missed by all who 
knew and loved her.


Marilee is survived by her husband of 45 years, Daniel Walker of 
Edwards, Missouri; two daughters: Candace Patton of Mountain 
Grove, Missouri, and Christy Hoagland and her husband, James, of 
Warsaw, Missouri; two sons: Curtis Walker of Warsaw, Missouri, 
and Clifford Walker of Warsaw, Missouri; one sister: Barbara Gault 
and her husband, Chester, of Mountain Grove, Missouri; two 
brothers: Richard Hardin and his wife, Marsha, of DeFuniak Springs, 
Florida, and Eric Hardin and his wife, Mary of Mountain Grove, 
Missouri; four grandchildren: Amber Willis, Christian Hoagland, 
Cameron Hoagland, and Quenevere Johnson; two great 
grandchildren: Faye Hoagland and Martha Hoagland; several nieces 
and nephews and a host of family and friends.




A Celebration of Life service will be Monday, September 19, 2022 at 
11:00 am at The Church of Living Water, 24498 Hwy 65, Warsaw, 
MO officiated by Pastor Daniel Yoder. 
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